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 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

1 WJA-0002 FURNITURE POLISH 

SPARTAN SPA-6120 OR APPROVED EQUAL FORTIFIED 
W/LEMON OIL  AEROSOL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 5003 

12 – 18 OZ 
29.30 

.136 

ZENA BRITE  

494725 
12 – 20 OZ 

28.97 

.121 

NO BID HITECH 

 EJ-811 
12 – 20 OZ 

21.35 

.089 

NO BID NO BID SPARTAN 

6120 
12 – 20 OZ 

50.33 

.2097 

LEMON SENSE 

#100513 
36 – 18 OZ 

90.90/CASE 

.14028 

2 WJA-0003 HOSPITAL GRADE DISINFECTANT 
AIR WICH GOLD LEAF LABEL MIST, LYSOL OR 

APPROVED EQUAL AEROSOL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 5013 
12 – 20 OZ 

33.58 

.140 

SPARTAN 
6076 

12 – 20 OZ 

35.00 
.146 

NO BID HITECH 
EJ-015 

12 – 20 OZ 

23.53 
.098 

NO BID NO BID   

3 WJA-0005 URINAL DEODORANT BLOCKETTS 

4 OZ BLOCK WRAPPED IN HEAT SEALED AIR TIGHT 
CELLOPHANE DOZEN BLOCKS PER BOX 12 BOXES PER 

CASE 40 LBS PER GROSS 

REN 3001 

12 – 4 OZ 
4.85 

.101 

FRESH 

 12-4PS 
12 – 4 OZ 

12 BX/CASE 

72.45/CASE 
.126 

NO BID FRESH FRE-12UPS 

144/PK 
62.26/PK 

.432 EACH 

NO BID NO BID   

4 WJA-0006 SOFT SCRUB CLEANSER 

LIQUID COMET OR APPROVED EQUAL 

REN 2816 

12 – 32 OZ 
22.00 

.057 

NCL 

SOFT&CREAMY 
12 QTS/CASE 

2.40/QT 

.075 

NO BID HITECH EJ-77 

12 – 32 OZ 
22.11 

.058 

NO BID    

5 WJA-0007 URINAL SCREEN 

 

REN 3009 

12 – 4 OZ 

11.00 

.229 

NO BID NO BID BIGD BD-652 

12 PACK 

7.62 

.635 

NO BID    

6 WJA-0008 

WFS-0008 

CLOROX BLEACH 

PACKED 6 GALLONS PER CASE 

KIK 5048 

6 GAL CASE 

11.88 
1.98 

AUSTIN 360 

6 GAL/CASE 

8.30/CASE 
1.383 

NO BID CLOROX 

CX-02490 

6 GAL/CASE 
10.30/CASE 

1.717 

NO BID ULTRA CLOROX 

02490 

6/96 OZ 
10.08/CASE 

1.68 

  

  ALTERNATE    PURE BRIGHT 

GERMICIDAL 
ULTRA BLEACH 

6 GAL/CASE 

7.38/CASE 
1.23 

    

7 WJA-0009 

WFS-0009 

PARLOR BROOM 

WEIGHT TO BE MIN OF 28 LBS PER DOZEN PACKED 1 
DOZ PER BUNDLE 

REN 3997 

12/CASE 
44.28/CASE 

3.69 

ROYAL 9920 

EACH 
3.86 

 

NO BID HITECH EJ-100P 

12 PACK 
35.52/PACK 

2.96 

NO BID    

8 WJA-0010 

WFS-0010 

MOP HANDLES 

SCREW ON TYPE IMPERIAL STA-FLAT OR APPROVED 
EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 2610 

12/CASE 
35.40/CASE 

2.95 

ROYAL JLH 

EACH 
2.58 

NO BID ABCO AB-01210NB 

12 PACK 
34.32/PACK 

2.86 

NO BID    

9 WJA-0011 MOP HEADS-RAYON 16 OZ 
SCREW ON TYPE FLAT CUT ENDS 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 2576 
12/CASE 

37.80/CASE 

3.15 

STAR 
ASA1-16 

EACH 

5.66 

NO BID LAYFLAT 
IM-40116 

12 PACK 

51.96/PACK 
4.33 

NO BID    



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

11 WJA-0013 

AFS-0013 

MOP HEADS COTTON 16 OZ 

SCREW ON TYPE LAY FLAT CUT ENDS 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 2578 

12/CASE 

31.68/CASE 
2.64 

GOLDEN STAR 

AWM8216 

EACH 
3.15 

NO BID LAYFLAT 

IM-70116 

12 PACK 
53.88/PACK 

4.49 

NO BID    

12 WJA-0014 
WFS-0014 

MOP HEADS- COTTON 24 OZ 
SCREW ON TYPE SAMPLE REQUIRED LAY FLAT CUT 

ENDS 

REN 2228 
12/CASE 

42.00/CASE 

3.50 

GOLDEN STAR 
AWM8224 

EACH 

3.94 

NO BID LAYFLAT 
IM-70124 

12 PACK 

67.44/PACK 
5.62 

NO BID    

13 WJA-0015 

WFS-0015 

COMBINATION MOP BUCKET AND WRINGER 

RUBBERMAID, CONTINENTAL OR APPROVED EQUAL 

APP 15500 

EACH 

33.15 

ACS M8000 

EACH 

35.54 

NO BID CONTINENTAL 

CN-226-312YW 

32.95 

NO BID    

14 WJA-0016 

WFS-0016 

SCRUBBING SPONGE 

3MC 35336 OR EQUAL CELLOUSE ON ONE SIDE HEAVY 

DUTY SCOURING PAD ON OTHER 

REN 2118 

20/BOX 

13.25/BOX 
.663 

ACS SC200 

MEDIUM 

8/BOX 
5BX/CASE 

.42 

 
 

 

 

NO BID ACS-SC200 

40/PACK 

17.17/PACK 
.429 

NO BID    

15 WJA-0018 
WFS-0018 

SCOURING PADS W/SOAP 
BRILLO INSTUTION SIZE OR EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO 
BID 

 

ACS ISP01PB 
12/BOX 

10BX/CASE 
22.20/CASE 

.185 

NO BID ROYAL RP-S1012 
12/10 CASE 

21.85/CASE 
.182 

NO BID    

16 WJA-0021 

WFS-0021 

TOILET TISSUE 

ROLL TYPE 1200 4.5X4.05” SHEETS PER ROLL 80 ROLLS 
GP14580 OR EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

APP 12506 

500/ROLL 
96/CASE 

32.50/CASE 

.339/ROLL 

SCA TS16365 

1000/ROLL 
96/CASE 

33.97/CASE 

.354/ROLL 

CENTRAL 

POLY TT1P96R 
96/CASE 

34.70/CASE 

.361/ROLL 

ATLAS APM125 

1000/ROLL 
96 ROLLS/CS 

33.43/CASE 

.348 

NO BID    

17 WJA-0022 

WFS-0022 

LARGE ROLL BATHROOM TISSUE 

SCA BRAND OR APPROVED EQUAL JR 9” 3.7” X 1000 IN 

SIZE 
PURCHASED ON STATE CONTRACT 

APP 12500 

9” ROLL 

12/CASE 
18.90/CASE 

1.575/ROLL 

VONDREHLE 

1209 

1000/ROLL 
12/CASE 

20.85/CASE 

1.738/ROLL 

CENTRAL 

POLY TT2P1000 

12/CASE 
18.57/CASE 

1.5475 

FAILED 
TESTING 

 

SCA TORK TJ0922 

1000/ROLL 

12 ROLLS/CS 
20.10/CASE 

1.675 

NO BID    

  ALTERNATE    SCA TORK 

TJ0924 

1000/ROLL 

12 ROLLS/CS 

22.95/CASE 
1.9125 

    

18 WJA-0024 

WFS-0024 

PAPER TOWEL 

ROLL TYPE DISPENSER TYPE, TWO PLY FULL SIZE 
JUMBO ROLL WHITE 30 ROLLS PER CASE MIN 100 

SHEETS PER ROLL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 6001 

90 SHT ROLL 
30ROLL/CASE 

19.28/CASE 

.643 

SCA 

HB 1995 A 
210/ROLL 

12/CASE 

16.99/CASE 
1.416 

NO BID GEORGIA PACIFIC 

GP-27300 
100/ROLL 

30ROLLS/CS 

22.19/CASE 
.740 

NO BID SOFTEX 

KRT100 
100/ROLL 

30 ROLLS/CS 

21.00/CASE 
.007 

 

 

  



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

20 WJA-0026 TOILET BOWL MOP 

 

REN 5136 

EACH 

.50 

ROYAL 

MB 150 

EACH 
.47 

NO BID WILEN WI-JS110000 

EACH 

.44 

NO BID    

21 WJA-0027 CARPET SANITIZER 
CONCENTRATED SANITIZER DEODORIZER CLEANER 

LIQUID ONE GAL SIZE 

REN 7000 
4 GAL/CASE 

36.48/CASE 

9.12 

*       TG 
QUICKSAN 

4 GAL/CASE 

28.00/CASE 
7.00 

NO BID HITECH EJ-SANI 
LEMON 

4 GAL/CASE 

16.93/CASE 
4.233 

NO BID    

22 WJA-0028 CARPET VACUMMING AID DEODORIZER & ANTI-

STATIC AGENT 
SC JOHNSON 03688 OR APPROVED EQUAL POWDERED 

VACUMMING AID, DEODORIZING BAKING SODA, ANTI-

STATIC AGENT 

REN 3051 

6 – 16 OZ 
13.00/CASE 

.135 

NO BID NO BID HITECH EJ-176 

12 – 16 OZ 
25.56/CASE 

.133 

NO BID   REFRESH 

#122633 
36 – 28 OZ 

183.60/CASE 

.18214 

23 WJA-0029 

WFS-0029 

EMERGENCY ABSORBENT GEL – BODY FLUID 

ABSORBER, FLUSHABLE, NON-TOXIC, 

BIODEGRADABLE, DEODERIZES.   NON-CARCINOGENIC 
INSTANT ACTING 12 OZ CAN 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 3020 

6 – 16 OZ 

27.50/CASE 
.286 

NO BID NO BID HITECH BD-150 

12 – 16 OZ 

24.73/CASE 
.129 

NO BID   POWDER DAM 

#122644 

36 – 8 OZ 
216.90/CASE 

.75313 

24 WJA-0030 AEROSOL BASEBOARD & BUILDUP STRIPPER 

HEAVY DUTY 19 OZ CAN 

REN 5022 

12 – 22 OZ 
34.00/CASE 

.129 

ZENA STRIP 

FOAM 493930 
12 – 20 OZ 

27.60/CASE 

.115 

NO BID HITECH EJ-856 

12 – 20 OZ 
22.24/CASE 

.0927 

NO BID   SFR 

#101214 
36 – 19 OZ 

150.30/CANS 

.21974 

25 WJA-0033 DUST MOP TREATMENT 

HIT-TECH OUST MOP TREATMENT OR APPROVED 

EQUAL MUST LEAVE NO OIL RESIDUE NET 14 OZ 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 5023 

12 – 20 OZ 

35.88/CASE 
.150 

CLAIRE DUST MOP 

C875 

12 – 14 OZ 
34.20/CASE 

.204 

NO BID HITECH EJ-875 

12 – 20 OZ 

25.69/CASE 
.107 

NO BID   SSA 

#43835 

36 – 14.75 OZ 
150.30/CASE 

.2831 

26 WJA-0034 CARPET SPOT FOAM REMOVER 

AEROSOL DISPENSED PRODUCT FOR USE IN REMOVING 
WATER SOLUBLE STAINS AND SOIL FROM CARPETS 

AND RUGS 

REN 5010 

12 – 18 OZ 
62.28/CASE 

.288 

CLAIRE CARP  

SPOTTER C879 
12 – 18 OZ 

27.00/CASE 

.125 
 

 

 
 

 

NO BID BETCO BC-42512 

12 – 32 OZ 
24.77/CASE 

.065 

NO BID   PD BULD 

#101156 
36 – 32 OZ 

120.30/CASE 

.10443 

27 WJA-0035 
WFS-0035 

GLASS CEANER 
AEROSOL GLASS CLEANER CONSISTING OF NON-IONIC 

DETERGENT, METHYNOL ALCOHOL & WATER CLEANS 

W/0 STREAKING DISPENSES AS A FOAM NET 19 OZ 12 
PER CASE 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 5002 
12 – 20 OZ 

22.00/CASE 

.092 

CLAIR GLASS CLEAN 
C050 

12 – 19 OZ 

19.90/CASE 
.087 

NO BID HITECH EJ-750 
12 – 20 OZ 

16.60/CASE 

.069 

NO BID   IN-SIGHT BULK 
#107568 

36 – 32 OZ 

114.30/CASE 
.09922 

  ALTERNATE        IN-SIGHT 
#121066-12 

36 – 19 OZ 

103.50/CASE 
.1513 

 

 
 

 



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

28 WJA-0036 

WFS-0036 

GUM REMOVER 

FREON BASED AEROSOL HARDENS GUMMY DEPOSITS 

FOR EASY REMOVAL 

REN 5012 

12 – 6 OZ 

26.15/CASE 
.363 

ZENA FREEZE 

496855 

12 – 7 OZ 
24.35/CASE 

.290 

NO BID HITECH EJ-813 

12 – 12 OZ 

19.48/CASE 
.135 

NO BID   GUM REMOVER 

#121214-12 

36 – 6.75 OZ 
107.80/CASE 

.4436 

29 WJA-0043 HOT/COLD CUP 6 OZ STYROFOAM NO BID DART 6J6 
1000/CASE 

11.73/CASE 

.01173 

NO BID DART DA-6J6 
1000/CASE 

11.70/CASE 

.0117 

NO BID  DART 6J6 
1000/CASE 

12.20/CASE 

.01220 

 

30 WJA-0044 HOT/COLD 12 OZ CUP STYROFOAM NO BID DART 12J12 
1000/CASE 

19.49/CASE 

.01949 

NO BID DART DA-12J12 
1000/CASE 

19.43/CASE 

.01943 

NO BID  DART 12J12 
1000/CASE 

20.15/CASE 

.02015 

 

31 WJA-0055 

WFS-0055 

LATEX EXAM GLOVE 

SIZE MEDIUM 100 TO BOX 10 BOXES TO A CASE 

REN 5217 

100/BOX 

10BOX/CASE 
62.40/CASE 

.0624 

AMERCARE 699M 

100/BOX 

10BX/CASE 
51.30/CASE 

.0513 

AMMEX #GP 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CS 
63.81/CASE 

.06381 

AMBITEX TI-

LMD5101 

100/BOX 
10BOX/CS 

44.65/CASE 

.04465 

AURELIA 

MED-LG 

100/BOX 
10 BX/CASE 

46.00/CASE 

.046 

JOBSELECT 

100-204 

10/100 
51.29/CASE 

.05129 

  

32 WJA-0057 
WFS-0057 

RUBBER GLOVES SIZE LARGE 
12”  PLAYTEX OR APPROVED EQUAL FULL LINED NON 

SLIP GRIP 

REN 5241 
PAIR 

.63 

ROYAL C5290L 
PAIR 

.61 

AMMEX #L417 
144 PR/CASE 

91.01/CASE 

.632 

AMBITEX TI-
LLB6500 

12/PACK 

6.73/PACK 
.561 

 

 

 

NO BID    

33 WJA-0059 BUFFER PADS GREEN 

3M OR APPROVED EQUAL 20” 

REN 2023 

5/CASE 
12.39/CASE 

2.478 

ACS 55-20 

5/CASE 
10.00/CASE 

2.00 

NO BID 3MC-35033 

5/PACK 
10.59/PACK 

2.118 

NO BID    

34 WJA-0060 BUFFER PADS BLACK 

3M OR APPROVED EQUAL 20” 

REN 2009 

5/CASE 
16.76/CASE 

3.352 

ACS 72-20 

5/CASE 
10.00/CASE 

2.00 

NO BID 3MC-35023 

5/PACK 
10.59/PACK 

2.118 

NO BID    

  ALTERNATE    3MC-08278 
HI PRO 

5/PACK 

44.98/PACK 
8.996 

    

35 WJA-0061 BUFFER PADS WHITE 

3M OR APPROVED EQUAL 20” 

REN 2068 

5/CASE 
12.39/CASE 

2.478 

ACS 41-20 

5/CASE 
10.00/CASE 

2.00 

NO BID 3MC-35063 

5/PACK 
10.59/PACK 

2.118 

NO BID    

36 WJA-0062 BUFFER PADS HOG HAIR 

ETC OR APPROVED EQUAL NATURAL HOG HAIR 20” 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 2100 

5/CASE 
13.15/CASE 

2.63 

ACS 37-20 

5/CASE 
10.00/CASE 

2.00 

NO BID 3MC-35089 

5/PACK 
10.59/PACK 

2.118 

NO BID    

37 WJA-0064 LONG HANDLE LOBBY DUST PAN RUBBERMAID OR 
APPROVED EQUAL 

REN 5124 
EACH 

8.05 

ACS B452 
6/CASE 

35.04/CASE 

5.84 

 CONTINENTAL 
CN-912BK 

EACH 

5.70 

NO BID    



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

38 WJA-0066 

WFS-0066 

LATEX EXAM GLOVES LARGE 

100 TO BOX 10 BOXES TO A CASE 

REN 5218 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
63.86/CASE 

.06386 

 

AMERCARE 699L 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
51.30/CASE 

.0513 

AMMEX #GP-L 

1000/CASE 

63.82/CASE 
.06382 

AMBITEX 

TI-VLG5101 

100/BOX 
10 BOX/CS 

28.50/CASE 

.02850 

AURELIA 

LRG-LG 

1000/CASE 
46.00/CASE 

.046 

JOBSELECT 

100-206 

10/100 
51.29/CASE 

.05129 

  

39 WJA-0067 VINYL EXAM GLOVES MEDIUM 

100 TOA  BOX 10 BOXES TO A CASE 

REN 5225 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
26.50/CASE 

.02650 

AMERCARE 1299 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
25.35/CASE 

.02535 

AMMEX  

 #V-M 

1000/CASE 
34.51/CASE 

.03451 

AMBITEX 

TI-VMD5101 

100/BOX 
10 BOX/CS 

28.50/CASE 

.02850 
 

 

 
 

NO BID JOBSELECT 

102-204 

10/100 
21.48/CASE 

.02148 

  

40 WJA-0068 

WFS-0068 

POWDER FREE VINYL EXAM GLOVES MEDIUM 100 TO A 

BOX 10 BOXES TO CASE 

REN 5249 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
33.45/CASE 

.033 

AMERCARE 2299 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
27.00/CASE 

.027 

AMMEX #VPF-

M 

1000/CASE 
35.52/CASE 

.03552 

AMBITEX 

TI-VMD5201 

100/BOX 
10 BX/CS 

29.39/CASE 

.02939 

PRIDE 

MED VPFG-E 

1000/BOX 
36.00/BOX 

.036 

JOBSELECT 

102-214 

10/100 
23.58/CASE 

.02358 

  

41 WJA-0069 

WFS-0069 

RUBBER GLOVES MEDIUM 

PLAYTEX OR APPROVED EQUAL FULLY LINED 12” NON 

SLIP GRIP 

REN 5240 

PAIR 

.63 

ROYAL C5290M 

PAIR 

.61 

AMMEX #L417 

144PR/CASE 

91.02/CASE 
.63208 

AMBITEX 

TI-LMD6500 

12/PACK 
6.73/PACK 

.561 

NO BID    

42 WJA-0070 BUFFER BAG 

APA391185 OR APPROVED EQUAL PKG OF 6 ONE HOLE 

ADV 56391185 

PACK 

26.76 

ADV 56391185 

PACK 

24.20 

NO BID ADV 56391185 

10/PACK 

21.65/PACK 

 

NO BID    

43 WJA-0071 BUFFER BAG 
APA 201569 OR APPROVED EQUAL PKG OF 10 TWO 

HOLE 

ADV 56201569 
PACK 

23.50 

ADV 56201569 
PACK 

21.26 

NO BID ADV 56201569 
10/PACK 

18.65/PACK 

1.865 

NO BID    

44 WJA-0075 VACUUM BAGS 

WINDSOR 5300 OR APPROVED EQUAL, TRIPLE CHECK 

MICROFILTER BAG 10 PER UNIT 

REN 8050 

PACK 

9.45 

WINDSOR 5300 

10/PACK 

9.05/PACK 

NO BID WINDSOR 

WN5300 

10/PACK 
10.62/PACK 

1.062 

NO BID    

45 WJA-0076 VACUUM BAGS 

ADVANCE POWER ONE 12/15 P/N 56704392 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL 8 PER UNIT 

NO BID ADV 56704409 

8 BAGS/PACK 

11.15/PACK 

1.394 

NO BID ADV 56704409 

8/PACK 

9.32/PACK 

1.165 

NO BID    

46 WJA-0077 AIR FRESH DISPENSER 
AUTOFRESH SELCT 400979 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

AERSOL DISPENSER 

REN 3531 
EACH  

21.50 

CALIF SCENTS 
CSP-1700 

EACH 

9.00 

NO BID HITECH 
CL-7MADISP 

EACH 

13.32 

NO BID    

47 WJA-0078 AIR FRESHNER FOR DISPENSER 
AUTOFRESH SELECT 400979 REFILL OR EQUAL 12 PER 

CASE 

BISD 462 
12 – 7 OZ CAN 

12/CASE 
39.75 

.473 

CALIF SCENTS 
036,007,008,005,044 

12 – 6.6 OZ 
28.80/CASE 

.364 

NO BID HITECH 
EJ-MT110 

EJ-MT112 
EJ-MT116 

12 – 11 OZ 

26.85 
.203 

NO BID    



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

48 WJA-0079 LONG HANDLE SCRAPPER 

48” LIGHT DUTY 10 PER CASE 

REN 3881 

EACH 

9.15 

IMPACT 3449 

6/PACK 

13.68 EACH 

NO BID CONTINENTAL 

CN-2562 

10/PACK 
79.90/PACK 

7.99 

 

NO BID    

49 WJA-0080 SCRAPER BLADES 

CONTINENTAL 21170605/2557 OR APPROVED EQUAL 4” 

IN LENGTH 10 PER PACK 

REN 3882 

10/PACK 

3.40/PACK 
.34 

IMPACT 3411B 

10/PACK 

7.57/PACK 
.757 

NO BID CONTINENTAL 

CN-2557 

10/PACK 
3.33/PACK 

.333 

NO BID    

50 WJA-0081 PAD HOLDER W/ 2 PC SWIVEL 

#2000 SERIES PAD HOLDER 12 PER CASE 
 

REN 2098 

EACH 
9.27 

ACS 618 

EACH 
3.04 

NO BID ACS 618 

12/PACK 
41.40/PACK 

3.45 

NO BID    

51 WJA-0085 
WFS-0085 

DISPENSER FOR LARGE ROLL BATHROOM TISSUE 
HOLDS SINGLE  JR. 9” TISSURE ROLL 

REN 5151 
EACH 

15.98 

VONDREHLE AE42V 
EACH 

4.70 

NO BID SCA 66TB 
EACH 

10.37 

NO BID    

52 WJA-0090 DISPENSER FOR LARGE ROLL BATHROOM           TISSUE, 

HOLDS DOUBLE (2) JR 9” ROLLS. 

REN 5150 

EACH 
26.20 

VONDREHLE 3253 

EACH 
5.85 

NO BID SCA 56T1 

EACH 
18.35 

NO BID    

53 WJA-0063 

WFS-0063 

PAPER TOWEL DISPENSER 

MECHANICAL HANDS FREE, 
HOLDS 8” WIDE ROLL, DOES NOT REQUIRE BATTERIES, 

AUTOMATIC MECHANICAL CUTTING DISPENSES 

CONSISTENT 11” PORTIONS OF ROLL TOWEL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 5156 

EACH 
49.75 

VONDREHLE 8861 

EACH 
25.50 

NO BID PALMER 

T207 ATS 
EACH 

41.85 

 

NO BID    

54 WJA-0058 PAPER TOWEL ROLL 

TO FIT MECHANICAL HANDS FREE DISPENSER, 8” WIDE 

ROLL WHITE 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

REN 6005 

6/CASE 

25.45/CASE 
4.242 

VONDREHLE 88012-B 

12/CASE 

39.00/CASE 
3.25 

NO BID SCA TORK 

RB8002 

800/ROLL 
6 ROLL/CS 

21.85/CASE 

3.641 
 

 

 
 

 

NO BID    

55 WJA-0097 
WFS-0097 

PAPER TOWEL ROLL 
TO FIT MECHANICAL HANDS FREE DISPENSER, 8” WIDE 

ROLL NATURAL 

VONDREHLE VON-88012-N OR APPROVED EQUAL 
(MUST BE 800 FT/ROLL) 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

APP 12501 
6/CASE 

19.53/CASE 

3.255 

VONDREHLE 88012-N 
12/CASE 

32.35/CASE 

2.696 

PUTNEY 
#P728N 

12 ROLLS/CS 

38.43/CASE 
3.2025 

SCA TORK RK8002 
800/ROLL 

6 ROLL/CS 

16.05/CASE 
2.675 

NO BID    

56 WJA-0087 VACUUM FILTER 
WINDSOR 5301ER OR APPROVED EQUAL, SENSOR AIR 

QUALITY MICROFILTER 

WINDSOR  5301 
EACH 

17.25 

WINDSOR 5301ER 
EACH 

7.99 

NO BID 
 

WINDSOR WN-
5301ER 

EACH 

13.95 

NO BID    

57 WJA-0094 WAX CUP 
MERIDAN 58MD OR APPROVED EQUAL 5 OZ IN SIZE 

2500 PER CASE 

NO BID *LFTB 
3PC214587 

2500/CASE 

81.56/CASE 
.0326 

NO BID SOLO 50-R53-0062 
3000/CASE 

84.23/CASE 

.028 

NO BID    



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

58 WJA-0100 SPRAY TRIGGER 

FITS 32 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLE (TRIGGER ONLY) 

REN 5113 

EACH 

.44 

IMPACT 4800 

250/CASE 

.41 

NO BID CONTINENTAL 

CN-902RW9 

EACH 
.35 

NO BID    

59 WJA-0101 SPRAY BOTTLE 

32 OZ PLASTIC BOTTLE (BOTTLE ONLY) 

REN 5121 

EACH 
.44 

IMPACT 5037WG 

EACH 
.42 

NO BID CONTINENTAL 

CN-932CG 
EACH 

.36 

NO BID    

60 WJA-0102 EXAM TABLE PAPER 

SMOTH 18”X225’ 12 ROLL PER CASE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID TIDI 

980912 

225/ROLL 
12 ROLL/CS 

37.50/CASE 

3.125 ROLL 

NO BID    

61 WJA-0110 SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSAL RECEPTACLE 

STAINLESS STEEL SMALL WALL MOUNT 

BOB 270 

EACH 

21.25 

IMPACT 1112 

12/CASE 

41.50 EACH 

NO BID HOSSPEC 

HO-NDIE 

EACH 
30.14 

NO BID    

62 WJA-0111 SANITARY NAPKIN WAX PAPER RECEPTACLE LINER 

FOR USE WITH WJA-0110 

HOSP 6141 

200/CASE 

10.95/CASE 
.055 

IMPACT 1101 

250/CASE 

16.89/CASE 
.06756 

NO BID HOSSPEC 

HO-K6260 

500/PACK 
13.15/PACK 

.0263 

 
 

 

NO BID    

63  
WJA-0200 

 
AIR TREATMENT 

OUTST, NEUTRA-AIR OR APPROVED EQUAL.  

ELIMINATES ODORS & GERMS IN THE AIR 

REN 5084 
12 – 6 OZ 

37.48/CASE 

.521 

ZENATIZE 495545 
12 – 12 OZ 

26.80/CASE 

.186 

NO BID HITECH EJ-018 
COUNTRY FRH 

12 – 20 OZ 

23.53 
.098 

NO BID   KONTROL 
SE #103781 

36 – 32 OZ 

166.50/CASE 
.14453 

64 WJA-0410 UTILITY PADS 4.6”X10”X0.9”, 5 PER BOX 4 BOXES PER 

CASE 

REN 2108 

20/PACK 

6.80/PACK 
.34 

ETC #0-#3 

20/CASE 

10.45/CASE 
.5225 

NO BID ACS 631 

5/BOX 

4 BOX/CS 
10.25/CASE 

.513 

NO BID    

65 WJA-0411 UTILITY PAD HANDLE 
ABCO 01104 OR APPROVED EQUAL 60”X15/16” 

REN 3955 
EACH 

3.68 

ROYAL HHA60 
EACH 

1.97 

NO BID ABCO AB-01104 
EACH 

1.99 

NO BID    

66 WJA-0412 DEFOAMER 
4.5 GALLSON PER CASE 

REN 7005 
4 GAL/CASE 

44.70/CASE 

11.175 

*TG 5093 
4 GAL/CASE 

15.52/CASE 

3.88 

NO BID HITECH 
EJ 5093 

4 GAL/CASE 

13.77/CASE 
3.443 

NO BID    

67 WFS-0007 DETERGENT 

POWDERED MEDIUM WEIGHT 25 LB BOX OR PAIL 

REN AWSAL 

40 LB/CONT 

25.99/CONT 
.650/LB 

NO BID NO BID HITECH 

EJ-EC0002 

50 LB/BOX 
18.95/BOX 

.379/LB 

 
 

 

 
 

NO BID    



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

68 WFS-0011 WAX PAPER 

- REYNOLDS CUT-RITE OR APPROVED EQUAL 

11.9”X75.7” 24 ROLLS PER CASE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID REYNOLD 

RY-7955 

250/ROLL 
6 ROLLS/CS 

32.63/CASE 

5.438 

NO BID    

69 WFS-0017 SCOURING PADS 
CS10 OR APPROVED EQUAL 6”X9” 

REN 2114 
20/PACK 

4.28/PACK 

.214 

ETC 9196 
60/CASE 

11.75/CASE 

.196 

NO BID CONTINENTAL 
CN-20940 

10/PACK 

1.68/PACK 
.168 

NO BID    

70 WFS-0023 NUTRITION MEAL KIT: SPORK KIT WITH SPIKE STRAW 

WALLACE PAKAGING KIT #3608 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

ITEM WILL BE DELIVERED TO SELECT SCHOOLS - 

SEE LIST OF SCHOOLS BELOW 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID NO BID NO BID  WALLACE 

WAL-3608 
10X10 

1000/PACK 

15.30/PACK 
.0153 

NO BID DISPOZ-0 

PSKF-SS-1000 
18.33/CASE 

.01833 

  

  ALTERNATE    WALLACE 

WAL-6408 
8X10 

1000/PACK 

14.77/PACK 
.01477 

 MVP 

96950 
1000 

13.69/CASE 

.01369 

  

71 WFS-0037 PLASTIC BOWLS 

DART 12BWW OR APPROVED EQUAL 12 OZ SAMPLE 

REQUIRED 

NO BID DART 12BWWF 

1000/CASE 

27.50/CASE 
.0275 

NO BID DART 

DA-12BWWF 

1000/CASE 
27.42/CASE 

.02742 

NO BID ENVIROFOAM 

FP10-3-1000 

1000/CASE 
18.65/CASE 

.01865 

DART 

12BWWF 

1000/CASE 
28.13/CASE 

.02813 

 

72 WFS-0038 PLASTIC BOWLS 
DART 5BWWF OR APPROVED EQUAL 5 OZ SAMPLE 

REQUIRED 

NO BID DART 5BWWF 
1000/CASE 

22.42/CASE 

.02242 

NO BID DART 
DA-5BWWF 

1000/CASE 

22.34/CASE 
.02234 

NO BID  DART 5BWWF 
1000/CASE 

22.93/CASE 

.02293 

 

73 WFS-0039 PLASTIC PLATES 

10CPWF OR APPROVED EQUAL 10.25”, 3 

COMPARTMENT, WHITE 500 PER CASE SAMPLE 

REQUIRED 

NO BID DART 10CPWF 

500/CASE 

32.35/CASE 
.0647 

NO BID DART  

DA-10CPWF 

1000/CASE 
32.25/CASE 

.03225 

NO BID **ENVIROFOAM 

FP10-3-500 

500/CASE 
26.85/CASE 

.0537 

DART 

10CPWF 

500/CASE 
33.07/CASE 

.06614 

 

74 WFS-0040 PLASTIC FORKS 
HEAVY DUTY MED WEIGHT 5,5” LONG, FLEXIBLE, 1000 

PER CASE 

NO BID DART F6BW 
1000/CASE 

9.85/CASE 

.00985 

NO BID WALLACE 
WAL-3540 

1000/CASE 

6.94 
.00694 

NO BID SPARTAN 
L1001 

1000/CASE 

6.54/CASE 
.0654 

  

75 WFS-0041 PLASTIC SPOONS 

HEAVY DUTY MED WEIGHT 5.5” LONG FLEXIBLE 1000 
PER CASE 

NO BID DART S6BW 

1000/CASE 
9.85/CASE 

.00985 

NO BID WALLAC 

WAL-3542 
1000/CASE 

6.94/CASE 

.00694 

NO BID SPARTAN 

L1003 
1000/CASE 

6.54/CASE 

.0654 

  

76 WFS-0042 SALAD PLATTER 
DART OR APPROVED EQUAL 9” LAMINATED FOAM 

PLASTIC 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID DART 9PRWQ 
500/CASE 

23.98/CASE 

.04796 

NO BID  GENPAK 
CAM 79 

500/CASE 

23.85/CASE 
.0477 

NO BID  DART 
9PRWQ 

500/CASE 

24.51/CASE 
.04902 

 



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

77 WFS-0044 PAPER SOUFFLE CUPS 0.75 OZ 

250 PER TUBE 20 TUBES PER CASE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID GENPAK 

GEN-F07S 

5000/CASE 
27.30/CASE 

.00546 

NO BID  GENPAK 

F075 

5000/CASE 
27.89/CASE 

.00558 

 

78 WFS-0045 PAPER SOUFFLE CUPS 2 OZ 
250 PER TUBE 20 TUBES PER CASE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID GENPAK 
GEN-F200 

5000/CASE 

38.63/CASE 
.007726 

NO BID 
 

 GENPAK 
F200 

5000/CASE 

39.47/CASE 
.007894 

 

79 WFS-0046 PAPER SOUFFLE CUPS 2 OZ W/LIDS 

2500 PER CASE INCLUDING LIDS 

NO BID NO BID NO BID SOLO 

B200/PL2 

2500/CASE 
43.85/CASE 

.01754 

NO BID    

80 WFS-0047 PAPER SOUFFLE CUPS 4 OZ 
250 PER TUBE 20 TUBES PER CASE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID GENPAK 
GEN F400 

5000/CASE 

49.95 
.00999 

NO BID  GENPAK 
F400 

5000/CASE 

51.05/CASE 
.01021 

 

81 WFS-0048 NAPKINS FOR DISPENSER 

8”X13.5” 10,000 PER CASE 

NO BID SCA D3052A 

10000/CASE 

23.15/CASE 
.002315 

NO BID CASCADES 

CT6-2569 

10000/CASE 
23.08/CASE 

.002308 

NO BID SOFTEX 

DN20500 

10000CASE 
22.52/CASE 

.002252 

  

82 WFS-0049 ALUMINUM FOIL INSTITUTION ROLL, 
STANDARD WEIGHT, 18”X1000’ ROLL 

NO BID WESTERN 281 
1 ROLL 

32.20 

NO BID WESTERN 
WP-W293 

29.45 

NO BID DURABLE  
51810 

26.29/ROLL 

DURABLE 
51810 

31.33/ROLL 

 
 

83 WFS-0050 ALUMINUM FOIL SHEETS POP-UP 9”X10.75” 200 SHEETS 
PER BOX 12 BOXES PER CASE 

NO BID WESTERN 631 
200SHT/BOX 

12 BOX/CASE 

40.97/CASE 
.01707 

NO BID WESTERN 
WP-631 

200SHT/BOX 

12 BOX/CASE 
43.30/CASE 

.0180416 

NO BID DURABLE 
91050 

3000/CASE 

38.17/CASE 
.012723 

DURABLE 
29100 

200SHT/BOX 

12 BX/CASE 
44.57/CASE 

.01857 

 

84 WFS-0051 PLASTIC WRAP 

POLYVINYL PLASTIC IN CUTTER BOX 24”X2000’ ROLL 

NO BID WESTERN 142 

1 ROLL 
15.10 

NO BID REYNOLDS 

RY-916M 
1 ROLL 

14.30 

NO BID VALUEWRAP 

VW242 
1 ROLL 

15.62 

  

85 WFS-0052 ZIPLOC BAGS 12”X12” 
3.0 MILL BAGS 500 PER PKG 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID ELKAY F21212 
1000/CASE 

49.85/CASE 

.04985 

CENTRAL 
POLY #CP12 

61.70/500 

.1234 

REYNOLDS 
RY-RF1011 

250/CASE 

13.39/CASE 

.05356 

 

 
 

NO BID    

86 WFS-0053 ZIPLOC BAGS 12”X18” 

3.0 MIL BAGS 500 PER PKG 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID WESTERN F21318 

1000/CASE 

80.70/CASE 
.08070 

CENTRAL 

POLY #CP18 

93.40/500 
.1868 

REYNOLDS 

RY-RF2011 

100/CASE 
13.14/CASE 

.1314 
 

 

 

NO BID    



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

87 WFS-0054 BROWN BAGS #8 

500 PER BUNDLE 

NO BID *ROSS WALLACE 

10.08/500 

.02016 

NO BID B&H 

BH-B08 

500/PACK 
9.30/PACK 

.0186 

NO BID    

88 WFS-0056 HANDGUARDS - LARGE 
POLYETHYLENE GLOVES, NON STERILE, NON-

MEDICAL USE, AMBIDEXTROUS, NO INTERFERENCE 

WITH GRASP OR FEEL 100 GLOVES TO BOX 10 BOXES 
TO CASE 

NO BID AMERCARE 399 
BOX 

.41 

NO BID INTEPLAST 
IG-GL LARGE 

100/BOX 

10 BOX/CASE 
3.90/CASE 

.0039 

INT-LRG-PG 
10000/CASE 

45.00/CASE 

.0045 

   

89 WFS-0058 PLASTIC APRONS 

PAPERLYNEN OR APPROVED EQUAL WHITE BIB STYLE 
EMBOSSED 18”X46” PACKED ON A ROLL 

GLX 590 

100/PACK 
11.50/PACK 

.115 

NO BID NO BID AMBITEX 

TI-P2846 
10/100 

33.80/CASE 

.0338 

NO BID    

90 WFS-0059 3 COMPARTMENT HINGED LID TRAYS 

9” DOME TOP 

NO BID DARNEL DU406301 

200/CASE 

12.75/CASE 
.06375 

NO BID PACTIV 

PT-YT019903 

150/CASE 
8.80/CASE 

.05867 

NO BID **ENVIROFOAM 

FHC9-3-200 

200/CASE 
19.95/CASE 

.09975 

  

91 WFS-0061 12 OZ SQUAT CONTAINER 

DART 12SJ20 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID DART 12SJ20 

500/CASE 
15.27/CASE 

.03054 

NO BID DART 

DA-125J20 
500/CASE 

15.21/CASE 
.03042 

NO BID  DART  

12SJ20 
500/CASE 

15.79/CASE 
.03158 

 

92 WFS-0062 12 OZ SQUAT CONTAINER LID 

DART 20JL OR APPROVED EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID DART 20JL 

1000/CASE 

13.75/CASE 
.01375 

NO BID DART 

DA-20JL 

1000/CASE 
13.68/CASE 

.01368 

NO BID  DART 

20JL 

1000/CASE 
14.20/CASE 

.01420 

 

93 WFS-0070 HANDGUARDS - MEDIUM 
POLYETHYLENE GLOVES, NON STERILE, NON-

MEDICAL USE, AMBIDEXTROUS, NO INTERFERENCE 

WITH GRASP OR FEEL 100 GLOVES TO BOX 10 BOXES 
TO CASE 

NO BID AMERCARE 399 
BOX 

.41 

NO BID INTEPLAST 
IG-GL MEDIUM 

1000/CASE 

3.90/CASE 
.0039 

INT-MED-PG 
10000/CASE 

45.00/CASE 

.0045 

   

94 WFS-0421 SINGLE SERVING PORTION TRAY 

PARPAK 21830 OR EQUAL 3 1/2X3 ½ X 1 ½ SIZE 15 MIL 

CLEAR OPS 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID PARPAK 21830 

2000/CASE 

29.85/CASE 
.014925 

NO BID PARPAK 

PAR-21830 

2000/CASE 
30.53/CASE 

.01526 

NO BID PARPAK 

21830 

2000/CASE 
30.59/CASE 

.01530 

  

95 WFS-0087 STRAWS MINI SIP 

POINED END AUTO FEED 80 PER BUNDLE 150 BUNDLES 

PER CASE 

NO BID NO BID NO BID TUBEX 

TU-FT1W 

12000/CASE 

37.70/CASE 
.003142 

NO BID DISPOZ-0 

SSW24-500R 

12000/CASE 

35.25/CASE 
.002938 

  

96 WFS-0088 REUSABLE  PLASTIC FORKS 

PERMAWARE 08123 OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE 

REQUIRED 

NO BID JONES ZYLON PCF-7 

432/CASE 

49.55/CASE 
.11469 

NO BID DESIGN 

BT-111 

36 DOZ/CASE 
64.30/CASE 

.14884 
 

 

 

NO BID    



97 WFS-0089 REUSABLE  PLASTIC SPOONS 

PERMAWARE 08121 OR APPROVED EQUAL SAMPLE 

REQUIRED 

NO BID JONES ZYLON PCT5-6 

432/CASE 
54.35/CASE 

.125810 

NO BID DESIGN 

BT-112 
36 DOZ/CASE 

50.52/CASE 

.11694 

NO BID    

98 WFS-0090 FOOD TRAY 
SOUTHLAND OR APPROVED EQUAL 3 POUND 

NO BID SQP 8703 
500/CASE 

15.85/CASE 

.0317 

NO BID SQP 
8153 

500/CASE 

12.45/CASE 
.0249 

NO BID SOUTHLAND 
#300 

500/CASE 

13.54/CASE 
.02708 

SOUTHLAND 
500/CS 

13.72 

.0274 

 

99 WFS-0091 FRENCH FRY BAG 4.5X3.5 SIZE NO BID NO BID NO BID FISCHER  

FPP602 
10/1000 

46.88/CASE 

.004688 

NO BID    

100 WFS-0092 SANDWICH BAGS 
FISCHER PAPER PRODUCTS 508 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

6.75” X 6.5” 1000 PER BOX 6 BOXES PER CASE 

NO BID ELKAY HD07 
2000/CASE 

8.20/CASE 

.004 

NO BID FISCHER 
FPP508 

6/1000 

52.18/CASE 
.008697 

STERLING 
675675 

3/2000 

26.84/CASE 
.004473 

BROWN PAPER 
CO. #710 

1000/CASE 

8.99/CASE 
.00899 

  

101 WFS-0093 STAINLESS STEEL SPONGE 

#12 ROYAL PAPER S73016 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

NO BID ACS 434PB 

12/BOX 
6 BOX/CASE 

3.57/DZ 

.2975 
 

NO BID ROYAL 

RP-5730/6 
12/PACK 

4.12/PACK 

.34333 

NO BID    

102 WFS-0098 3 COMPARTMENT HINGED LID TRAY 

BLACK 
8” DART 85HTB3 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID DARNEL DU405301B 

200/CASE 
13.65/CASE 

.06825 

NO BID GENPAK 

SN-243-3L 
200/CASE 

17.20/CASE 

.086 

NO BID  DART 

85HTB3 
200/CASE 

17.67/CASE 

.08835 

 

103 WFS-0099 
 

 

6 COMPARTMENT FOAM TRAY 
PACTIV PT-TH1-0601 OR APPROVED EQUAL 

ITEM WILL BE DELIVERED TO SELECT SCHOOLS - 

SEE LIST OF SCHOOLS BELOW 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID DARNEL DU2014601 
500/CASE 

19.50/CASE 

.039 

NO BID PACTIV 
TH1-0601 

500/CASE 

18.53/CASE 
.03706 

NO BID FOAM PACKAGING 
FST-6500 

500 COUNT 

18.18 
.03636 

  

  ALTERNATE      FOAM PKG 

FST-5500 
5 COMP 

15.76 

.315 

  

104 WFS-0100 COUNTER TOP NAPKIN DISPENSER 
GEORGIA PACIFIC EASYNAP 54510 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID SCA 324PS 
10 EACH 

NO CHARGE WITH 

NAPKIN ORDER 

NO BID GEORGIA PAC 
GP-54510 

NO CHARGE 

WITH NAPKIN 

ORDER 

NO BID    

105 WFS-0101 EMBOSSED DISPENSER NAPKINS 

6000 PER CASE 
GEORGIA PACIFIC EASYNAP 32002 OR APPROVED 

EQUAL 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

NO BID SCA DX900 

500/BOX 
12 BOX/CASE 

36.37/CASE 

.006061 

NO BID GEORGIA PAC 

GP-32002 
6000/CASE 

38.95/CASE 

.006492 

NO BID    

106 WFS-0102 6 COMPARTMENT LAMINATE FOAM TRAY PACTIV PT-
TH1-0600 OR APPROVED EQUAL ITEM WILL BE 

DELIVERED TO SELECT SCHOOLS - SEE LIST OF 
SCHOOLS BELOW 

SAMPLE REQUIRED 

 

NO BID DARNEL DU2014601 
500/CASE 

19.50/CASE 
 

NO BID PACTIV 
PT-TK1-T600 

500/CASE 
DISCONTINUED 

NO BID ENVIROFOAM 
FT6-500 

500/CASE 
23.23/CASE 

 

  



 ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION 

 
 

AMSAM BROUSSARD CENTRAL 

POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

  ALTERNATE     NO BID ENVIROFOAM 

5 COMP 

500 CS 
FT5-500 

21.74 

  

107 WFS-0419 DISPOSABLE WIPES 
GP DINAWIPE HEAVY DUTY AIRLAID FOOD SERVICE 

WIPERS #29419 OR APPROVED EQUAL 13”X17” SIZE 40 

PER PKG 240 PKGS PER CASE 

NO BID SCA 192181A 
240/CASE 

21.50/CASE 

.089583 

NO BID CASCADES 
CTG-30700 

200/CASE 

14.56/CASE 
.0728 

NO BID    

108 PA-1 MATS 4X6 

ANDERSON MASTERPIECE GOLD OR APPROVED EQUAL 

INDOOR/OUTDOOR 

AND 200 

EACH 

88.00 

ANDERSON MASTER 

SELECT 

EACH 
79.40 

NO BID ANDERSON 

265 

EACH 
82.85 

NO BID    

109 PA-2 MATS 3X5 

ANDERSON MASTERPIECE GOLD OR APPROVED EQUAL 
INDOOR/OUTDOOR 

 

AND 200 

EACH 
58.00 

ANDERSON MASTER 

SELECT 
EACH 

49.65 

NO BID ANDERSON 

265 
EACH 

51.74 

NO BID    

110 PA-3 JANITOR CART 

RUBBERMAID JANITOR CART 6150 OR APPROVED 
EQUAL 

RCP 6173 

EACH 
120.15 

ROYAL IM6856 

EACH 
95.44 

NO BID RUB-617388 

EACH 
110.33 

NO BID    

  ALTERNATE    CONTINNENTAL  

CN-184GY 
EACH 

82.56 

    

111 PA-4 X CART 
RUBBERMAID X CART 4045 WITH BAGS OR APPROVED 

EQUAL 

NO BID NO BID NO BID CONTINENTAL 
275/276 

EACH 

89.43 

NO BID    

112 PA-5 55 GALLON CONTAINER 
RUBBERMAID BRUTE 55 GAL  OR APPROVED EQUAL 

GRAY 

RCP 2655 
EACH 

58.45 

NO BID NO BID RUB 2655 
EACH 

53.66 

NO BID    

  ALTERNATE    CONTINENTAL 

5500 

EACH 
37.31 

    

113 PA-6 DOME TOP W/FLAP 

FOR 55 GAL CONTAINER RUBBERMAID 2657 OR 

APPROVED EQUAL GRAY 

RCP 2657-88 

EACH 

78.00 

NO BID NO BID RUB-265788 

EACH 

71.73 

NO BID    

  ALTERNATE    CONTINENTAL 

55502Y 

EACH 
50.52 

NO BID    

114 PA-7 32 GAL CONTAINER 
RUBBERMAID 2632 OR APPROVED EQUAL GRAY`` 

RCP 2632 
EACH 

25.25 

 
 

 

NO BID NO BID RUB 2632 
EACH 

22.70 

 
 

 

 
 

NO BID    
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POLY 

ECONOMICAL INTERBORO PON FOOD SCHNEIDER STATE 

CHEMICAL 

  ALTERNATE    CONTINENTAL 

CN-3200 

EACH 
13.32 

    

 
 

BID AWARD 

 
NOT AS SPECIFIED 

 

NO SAMPLE – SAMPLE REQUIRED 
 

DID NOT COMPLETE REQUIRED INFORMATION ON BID FORMS 

 

 

ITEMS WFS-0023 AND WFS-0099 WILL BE DELIVERED TO THE FOLLOWING SCHOOLS: 

 
JUBAN PARK ELEMENTARY - 12555 BROWN ROAD, DENHAM SPRINGS LA  70726 

 

JUBAN PARK JR HIGH - 12425 BROWN ROAD, DENHAM SPRINGS LA  70726 
 

LIVE OAK HIGH - 35086 OLD LA HWY 16, WATSON LA 70786 

 
SEVENTH WARD ELEMENTARY - 24495 LA HWY 16, DENHAM SPRINGS LA  70726 

 

SOUTH FORK ELEMENTARY - 23300 WALKER SOUTH ROAD, DENHAM SPRINGS LA  70726  
 

 

*REQUEST LA STATE PREFERENCE – MFG IN HARAHAN, LA 
 

** ENVIROFOAM IS STRONGER THAN CONVENTIONAL FOAM, LESS EXPENSIVE THAN PLASTIC, AND BETTER FOR THE ENVIRONMENT. 

 


